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ANGEL TREE
CHRISTMAS!

Angel Tree Christmas™ is a Prison
Fellowship program that gives to over
300,000 United States children of
incarcerated parents each year. Gifts
are delivered with a Gospel message
as well as a love message from their
parent.

Angel Tree works with organizations
and churches to deliver the gifts to
children's doors in time for Christmas.

Children of incarcerated parents often
have no tangible evidence that their
parent loves them. All they know is
they are gone. 

An Angel Tree gift at Christmas from
their incarcerated parent lets them
know that they do in fact have a
loving parent. This “Angel Tree
Connection” is often what allows
returning parents to begin reuniting
with their children and families. 

WHY ANGEL TREE?

DECEMBER

QUESTIONS?
STEPHANIE LEWIS
DNPA ANGEL TREE COORDINATOR
909-709-1223

College of Graduate Nursing’s
DNPA is supporting

I’M READY TO GIVE!
Shop the Wishlist
https://www.amazon.com/hz/wis
hlist/ls/2VMOW8PDBDG5O?
ref_=wl_share 

Check the address
No need to ship or wrap! Just 
verify the DNPA address is 
selected at check out.
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stephanie.lewis@westernu.edu
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